
Specifications 
Assembled Product Dimensions (L x W x H) 
2.50 x 2.50 x 7.79 Inches 

 
 

Directions 
Instructions 
Directions for Use: Before attempting to start engine, spray starting fluid into the air cleaner or intake air 
stream for 2-3 seconds (no more than 3 seconds), stand clear of engine, then start engine. Do Not let can 
contact battery terminal or starter solenoid. Do Not spray while ignition is on or cranking. Do Not use product 
to mount or seal tires. Attention: Before use, read and follow engine owner/operator manual recommendations. 
Improper use and use in some glow-plug-equipped diesels could result in engine damage and/or bodily harm. 
Safe Handling Instructions 
DANGER: EXTREMELY FLAMMABLE. VAPORS MAY CAUSE FLASH FIRE. VAPORS HARMFUL. 
EXCESSIVE INHALATION MAY BE FATAL. MAY CAUSE EYE AND SKIN IRRITATION. MAY BE 
HARMFUL OR FATAL IF SWALLOWED. CONTENTS UNDER PRESSURE. Keep away from heat, 
sparks and open flames. DO NOT smoke. Extinguish all flames and pilot lights, turn off stoves, heaters, 
electric motors and other sources of ignition during use and until all vapors are gone. DO NOT let can contact 
battery terminals or starter solenoid. DO NOT use product to mount or seal tires. Use only with adequate 
ventilation. Avoid breathing high concentrations of vapor. Deliberate inhalation of the contents of this can is 
extremely dangerous and may be fatal. Avoid contact with eyes and prolonged or repeated contact with skin. 
DO NOT puncture or incinerate container. DO NOT expose to direct sunlight or other sources of heat or store 
at temperatures above 120°F (49°C). Wash hands after using product. KEEP OUT OF THE REACH OF 
CHILDREN. CONTAINS: HEPTANE (CAS 142-82-5), DIETHYL ETHER (CAS 60-29-7), CARBON 
DIOXIDE (CAS 124-38-9), PROPANE (CAS 74-98-6), N-BUTANE (106-97-8). This diesel fuel additive 
complies with the federal low sulfur content requirements for use in diesel motor vehicles and non-road 
engines. FIRST-AID:. EYES: Flush with large amounts of water. Get medical attention if irritation persists. 
SKIN: Wash exposed areas with soap and water. INHALATION: If affected, remove to fresh air. IF 
SWALLOWED: DO NOT induce vomiting. Call a physician or poison control center immediately for 
instructions. 

 
 

Warnings 
Warning Text 
DANGER: EXTREMELY FLAMMABLE. VAPORS MAY CAUSE FLASH FIRE. VAPORS HARMFUL. 
EXCESSIVE INHALATION MAY BE FATAL. MAY CAUSE EYE AND SKIN IRRITATION. MAY BE 
HARMFUL OR FATAL IF SWALLOWED. CONTENTS UNDER PRESSURE. Keep away from heat, 
sparks and open flames. DO NOT smoke. Extinguish all flames and pilot lights, turn off stoves, heaters, 
electric motors and other sources of ignition during use and until all vapors are gone. DO NOT let can contact 
battery terminals or starter solenoid. DO NOT use product to mount or seal tires. Use only with adequate 
ventilation. Avoid breathing high concentrations of vapor. Deliberate inhalation of the contents of this can is 
extremely dangerous and may be fatal. Avoid contact with eyes and prolonged or repeated contact with skin. 
DO NOT puncture or incinerate container. DO NOT expose to direct sunlight or other sources of heat or store 
at temperatures above 120°F (49°C). Wash hands after using product. KEEP OUT OF THE REACH OF 
CHILDREN. CONTAINS: HEPTANE (CAS 142-82-5), DIETHYL ETHER (CAS 60-29-7), CARBON 
DIOXIDE (CAS 124-38-9), PROPANE (CAS 74-98-6), N-BUTANE (106-97-8). This diesel fuel additive 
complies with the federal low sulfur content requirements for use in diesel motor vehicles and non-road 
engines. FIRST-AID:. EYES: Flush with large amounts of water. Get medical attention if irritation persists. 
SKIN: Wash exposed areas with soap and water. INHALATION: If affected, remove to fresh air. IF 
SWALLOWED: DO NOT induce vomiting. Call a physician or poison control center immediately for 
instructions. 
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